
Rev. Jared M. Webb 
(765)506-4858 
 
Covenant/Agreement for Spiritual Direction 

We are entering together into a spiritual direction relationship. Spiritual direction is a 
ministry that involves discerning and responding to the work of God in our lives for the 
purpose of spiritual growth and healing. Spiritual direction is distinct from other helping 
ministries, such as psychotherapy, pastoral counseling, mentoring or analysis. Nevertheless, 
in the course of our work we may discuss psychological and relational issues. Spiritual 
direction is also not financial advice and any decisions and actions you may take in that 
regard are done without my advice or recommendation and are purely your responsibility. I 
may refer you to another spiritual director or another helping ministry at any time at your 
request or in the event that I feel that another would better serve you. 

 

I affirm that I am a member of ESDA and I ascribe to their “Code of Ethics.”  If you 
would like more info on both ESDA and their Code of Ethics, please see 
https://www.graftedlife.org/spiritual-direction/esda/code-of-ethics 
 
I set the fees for my services and my current rate is [$40] per session. This is payable by cash, 
check, Venmo, Cash App, or Apple Pay 

I will maintain confidentiality regarding any content that is shared during our direction 
sessions, including your identity. I may reveal aspects of content shared during our sessions 
with other spiritual directors solely for the purposes of supervision and/or consultation. I 
will not, however, reveal your identity, and these directors/supervisors ascribe to similar 
ethical guidelines. Information regarding the risk of serious harm to you or another may 
necessitate emergency intervention on my part, and at such times I may institute a change in 
this confidentiality agreement with your knowledge. 

 

Either one of us are free to end our spiritual direction relationship at any time. We simply 
need to inform one another of our desire to do so and, if possible, have a final meeting. 

 

If you have any questions about our covenant/agreement, please feel free to ask me at any 
time. 
 
In Christ, 
 

 
 
 
 
By signing below, I confirm that I have read, understand, and agree to the above covenant. 
 
____________________               __________________ 
Printed Name                                 Date 
 
____________________ 
Signature


